
132 GARDEN GATE WAY
https://vizorealty.com

Welcome to this beautifully designed 4-bedroom Craftsman-style home located in
Lexington’s sought-after Summerlake neighborhood. Situated directly across from
one of the community common areas and within walking distance to the
playground and athletic field, this home blends comfort, convenience, and
exceptional neighborhood amenities.Inside, you’ll find an inviting open-concept
floor plan with a two-story great room that fills with natural light. The gourmet
kitchen boasts granite countertops, a large island, wall oven, smooth top range,
and a spacious eat-in areaâ��perfect for entertaining or family meals.The main-
level primary suite offers thoughtful design with a walk-in closet that connects
directly to the laundry/mudroom, making daily living a breeze. Upstairs, you’ll find
three generously sized bedroomsâ��each with its own walk-in closetâ��a full
bathroom, and a versatile loft area.Step outside to enjoy a large covered back
porch, ideal for relaxing or outdoor dining. A rear-entry garage keeps the curb
appeal clean and classic.Summerlake residents enjoy access to top-tier amenities,
including a 15-acre stocked fishing pond, pool and clubhouse, disc golf course,
nature trails, boat/RV storage, playground, and sports field. Zoned for award-
winning Lexington One schools and Summerlake offers a paved walking path to
Beechwood Middle School. This home truly offers the best of lifestyle and
locationâ��schedule your showing today! Disclaimer: CMLS has not reviewed and,
therefore, does not endorse vendors who may appear in listings.

• Single Family
• RESIDENTIAL

• ACTIVE



Basics
Date added: Added 13 hours ago Category: RESIDENTIAL

Type: Single Family Status: ACTIVE

Building Details
Basement: No Basement Exterior material: Fiber Cement-Hardy Plank, Stone

Amenities & Features
Features: Back Porch - Covered, Front Porch - Covered, Gutters - Full


