
$335,000

300 WESSINGER DRIVE
https://vizorealty.com

Charming Renovated Ranch in the Heart of LexingtonWelcome to 300
Wessinger Driveâ��a beautifully updated ranch-style home offering
timeless charm and modern convenience in one of Lexingtonâ��s most
desirable locations.This 3-bedroom, 2-bathroom home spans
approximately 1,869 square feet and sits on a generous 0.46-acre lot. Built
in 1964, it has been thoughtfully renovated to blend classic character with
contemporary features. The inviting interior boasts a rustic-chic kitchen
equipped with stainless steel appliances, a gas range, and upgraded,
family-friendly cabinetry. A custom eat-in picnic counter adds warmth and
functionality, while stylish light fixtures and a cozy fireplace enhance the
ambiance throughout the home.An additional room with a closet provides
flexibilityâ��ideal as a fourth bedroom, home office, or future primary
suite. Outside, enjoy a spacious backyard complete with a deck, perfect for
entertaining or relaxing.Located minutes from downtown Lexington, this
home offers easy access to shopping, dining, and top-rated schools,
including River Bluff High School.Donâ��t miss your chance to own this
move-in-ready gem that combines comfort, style, and an unbeatable
location. Schedule your private showing today! Disclaimer: CMLS has not
reviewed and, therefore, does not endorse vendors who may appear in
listings.

• 3 beds
• 2 baths

• Single Family

• RESIDENTIAL

• ACTIVE



Basics
Date added: Added 2 days ago Listing Date: 2025-05-27

Price per sqft: $179.24 Category: RESIDENTIAL

Type: Single Family Status: ACTIVE

Bedrooms: 3 beds Bathrooms: 2 baths

Floors: 1 floor Year built: 1964

TMS: 004317-07-003 MLS ID: 609492

Pool on Property: No Full Baths: 2

Financing Options: Cash,Conventional,FHA,VA Cooling: Central,Heat Pump 1st Lvl

Building Details
Heating features: Central,Gas 1st Lvl Garage: Carport Attached

Garage spaces: 1 Foundation: Crawl Space

Water Source: Public Sewer: Septic

Style: Ranch,Traditional Basement: No Basement

Exterior material: Brick-All Sides-AbvFound New/Resale: Resale

Amenities & Features
Features: Deck, Front Porch - Covered, Shed

HOA Info
HOA: N

Nearby Schools



School District: Lexington One Elementary School: Lexington

Middle School: Lexington High School: River Bluff

Listing Courtesy Of
Listing Office: Century 21 803 Realty Listing Agent: Mariah, Matthews


