
5 BLUE MOUNTAIN COURT
https://vizorealty.com

Welcome to your next home! 5 Blue Mountain Court is a mainly one level
floor plan located in the highly desirable Milford Park subdivision. The
interior and exterior of this home has been very well maintained. Upon entry
you are greeted with an expansive great room with high ceilings, a fireplace
and easy access to the kitchen and formal dining room. The kitchen features
plenty of cabinetry, stainless steel appliances, granite, and tile backsplash.
Off the eat in kitchen and sunroom is a gigantic back deck! The backyard
view is heavily tree lined ensuring privacy. Just off the kitchen is a separate
laundry room. The secondary bedrooms are spacious and share the hall
bathroom. The Master suite is very sizeable with a custom walk-in closet and
newly updated bathroom! The Master bathroom boasts of a stunning tiled
shower, separate tub, beautiful wood vanity and fantasy brown marble
countertops! Upstairs is a room over garage which could easily be converted
into a bedroom. There is walk in attic access for maximum convenience and
storage. All this home needs is your personal touch. Beautiful community
pool and a location that cannot be beat! Walking distance to Ballentine
Elementary school. Within minutes to shopping, dining, entertainment and
the interstate! Do not miss out on this gem. Disclaimer: CMLS has not
reviewed and, therefore, does not endorse vendors who may appear in
listings.

• Single Family
• RESIDENTIAL

• ACTIVE



Basics
Date added: Added 16 hours ago Category: RESIDENTIAL

Type: Single Family Status: ACTIVE

Building Details
Basement: No Basement Exterior material: Vinyl

Amenities & Features
Features: Front Porch - Covered, Gutters - Full


