
$239,500

545 INNSBROOK DRIVE
https://vizorealty.com

-Roof replaced 2023 for added peace of mind-2 bathrooms completely
renovated in 2023-New exterior pain, ceiling fans in den and bedrooms,
ample cabinets and storageWelcome to this classic all -brick ranch with a
large front yard. This home has a large covered front porch. The attached
side entry double-carport has a large exterior room to use as you please.
From the carport, you enter into the kitchen that has stained cabinetry
with am eat-in space. Off the kitchen is a spacious laundry room with tons
of cabinet storage. The kitchen opens into a large living room with a
beautiful brick fireplace. Off the foyer is a formal living and dining room
with an abundance of natural light. The natural light extends to the front
bedroom and a completely renovated bathroom. The Master Bedroom has
an adjoining Jack and Jill bathroom, also completely renovated with a
beautiful, large walk-in shower. This leads to the third bedroom, perfect for
a nursery or child bedroom. This home has a beautiful brick patio with a
built-in grill/fireplace, with access from the carport and living room. The
patio overlooks a shady, expansive and fenced in backyard. Whether
you’re looking for your first home, forever home or an amazing investment
home….this house could be the one for you. Disclaimer: CMLS has not
reviewed and, therefore, does not endorse vendors who may appear in
listings.

• 3 beds
• 2 baths

• Single Family

• RESIDENTIAL

• ACTIVE



Basics
Date added: Added 4 weeks ago Listing Date: 2025-03-17

Price per sqft: $135.93 Category: RESIDENTIAL

Type: Single Family Status: ACTIVE

Bedrooms: 3 beds Bathrooms: 2 baths

Floors: 1 floor Lot size, acres: 95x141x165x154 acres

Year built: 1966 TMS: 06013-06-13

MLS ID: 604210 Pool on Property: No

Full Baths: 2 Financing Options: Cash,Conventional

Cooling: Central

Building Details
Heating features: Central,Floor Furnace Garage: Carport Attached

Garage spaces: 2 Foundation: Crawl Space

Water Source: Public Sewer: Public

Style: Ranch Basement: No Basement

Exterior material: Brick-All Sides-AbvFound New/Resale: Resale

Amenities & Features
Features: Front Porch - Covered, Grill, Patio

HOA Info
HOA: N

Nearby Schools



School District: Richland One Elementary School: Rhame

Middle School: St Andrews High School: Columbia

Listing Courtesy Of
Listing Office: Keller Williams Realty Listing Agent: Rhonda, Sweatt


